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Peer-Reviewed Publications (* Denotes publications with students) 
 
*Lauderdale, S. A., Griffin, S., Lahman, K. R., Mbaba, E., & Tomlinson, S. (2024, in review). 

Unveiling public stigma for Borderline Personality Disorder: A comparative study of 
artificial intelligence and mental health care providers. Manuscript submitted to 
Personality and Mental Health.  

  
*Lahman, K. R., Lauderdale, S. A., Allen, J., & Smith, B. (2024, in review). Manifestation 

determination reviews: The biasing effects of manifestation determination knowledge and 
perceptions of Black and White students’ behaviors. Manuscript submitted to School 
Psychology. 

 
*Lauderdale, S. A., Lahman, K. R., & Desai, H. (2024, accepted for publication). Clarifying 

some confusion: Indecisiveness and procrastination and distinct constructs. Manuscript 
submitted to Current Psychology.  

 
*Lahman, K., Messerli, M., Jackson, J., Lauderdale, S., & Keller-Margulis, M. (2023, 

September). Managing perfectionism: Reframing the relationship between validation and 
academic performance. Communiqué, 52(1), 4-5. 

 
*Staley, G., Zaidan, A., Henley, K., Childers, L. G., Daniel, R., Lauderdale, S., & McGuire, A. 

P. (2022). Commending rather than condemning veterans: Moral elevation and stigma for 
veterans with military sexual trauma and substance use. BMC Psychology. 
https://doi.org/10.1186/s40359-022-01002-4 

 
Lauderdale, S. (2022). People with dementia and their interaction with the police. In M. P. 

Bratina (Ed.), Forensic mental health: Framing integrated solutions (2nd ed.). New York, 
New York: Taylor and Francis/Routledge. 

 
*Lauderdale, S. A., Martin, K. J., Oakes, K. R., Moore, J. M., & Balotti, R. J. (2022). Pragmatic 

screening of anxiety, depression, suicidal ideation, and substance misuse in older adults. 
Cognitive and Behavioral Practice. 

 
*Lauderdale, S. A., & Oakes, K. R. (2021). Factor structure of the revised Indecisiveness Scale 

and association with risks for and symptoms of anxiety, depression, and attentional 
control. Journal of Rational-Emotive and Cognitive Behavioral Therapy. 

 
Mohlman, J., Lauderdale, S., & Wuthrich, V. (2019). Subscales of the Fear Survey Schedule-III 

in Community Dwelling Older Adults – Relations to Clinical and Cognitive Measures. 
Clinical Gerontologist. 

 
*Lauderdale, S. A., Martin, K., & Moore, J. (2018). Aversive indecisiveness predicts risks for 

and symptoms of depression and anxiety over avoidant indecisiveness. Journal of 
Rational-Emotive and Cognitive Behavior Therapy. https://doi.org/10.1007/s10942-018-
0302-x 
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*Caldwell, H., & Lauderdale, S. A. (2018). Public stigma for men and women veterans with 
combat-related PTSD. Current Psychology. https://doi.org/10.1007/s12144-018-9940-5 

 
*Mohlman, J., DeVito, A., Dobkin, R., & Lauderdale, S. (2017). Initial outcomes of a combined 

cognitive behavioral therapy and attention process training intervention for older adults 
with Parkinson’s disease. Practice Innovations, 2, 234-242. 
http://dx.doi.org/10.1037/pri0000056 

 
Cassidy-Eagle, E., Lauderdale, S., & Unti, L. (2015). Mixed anxiety and depression. S. 

Whitbourne (ed.). Encyclopedia of adulthood and aging. Hoboken, New Jersey: John 
Wiley and Sons. 

 
Hilliard Sorocco, K., & Lauderdale, S. (Eds.) (2011). Cognitive behavior therapy with older 

adults: Innovations across care settings. New York, New York: Springer Publishing. 
 
Lauderdale, S., Cassidy-Eagle, E.L., Thi-My-Huyen Nguyen, C.,& Sheikh, J.I. (2011). Late-life 

anxiety: Prevalence, assessment, and treatment. In M. Anthony & G. Maletta (Eds.) 
Principles and Practice of Geriatric Psychiatry (2nd ed.). New York: Lippincott and 
Wilkins. 

 
Lauderdale, S., Cassidy-Eagle, E.L., & Sheikh, J.I. (2008). Managing late-life anxiety. Current 

Psychiatry, 71, 83-93. 
 
Carlson, E., Lauderdale, S.A., Hawkins, J., & Sheik, J.I. (2008). Posttraumatic stress and 

aggression among veterans in nursing care. Journal of Geriatric Psychiatry and 
Neurology, 21, 61-71. 

 
Gant, J.R., Steffen, A.M., & Lauderdale, S.A. (2007). Comparative outcomes of two distance-

based interventions for male caregivers of family members with dementia. American 
Journal of Alzheimer’s Disease and Other Dementias, 22, 120-128. 

 
*Lauderdale, S.A., Kelly, C., & Sheikh, J.I. (2006). Anxiety disorders in older adults: Prevalence, 

assessment, and treatment. In M. Anthony & G. Maletta (Eds.) Principles and Practice of 
Geriatric Psychiatry (429-448). New York: Lippincott and Wilkins. 

 
Cassidy, E.L., Lauderdale, S.A., Gandy, S.L., & Sheikh, J.I. (2005). Pharmacological treatment 

of mixed anxiety and depression in older adults. Journal of Geriatric Psychiatry and 
Neurology, 18, 83-88. 

 
Cassidy, E.L., Kelly, K., Lauderdale, S.A., Power, R.E., O’Hara, R., Sheikh, J.I. (2004). Assisted 

living facilities: New frontiers in dementia care. Long-term Care Interface, 5, 49-53. 
 
Sheikh, J. I., Lauderdale, S. A., & Cassidy, E. L. (2004). Efficacy of sertraline for panic disorder 

in older adults: A preliminary open-label trial. American Journal of Geriatric Psychiatry, 
12, 230. 

 

http://psycnet.apa.org/doi/10.1037/pri0000056
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Lauderdale, S.A., & Sheikh, J.I. (2003). Anxiety disorders in older adults. Clinics in Geriatric 
Medicine, 19, 721-741. 

 
Lauderdale, S.A., & Gallagher-Thompson, D. (2002). Men providing care: What do they need 

and how can we do it. Clinical Gerontologist, 26, 53-70. 
 
Lauderdale, S.A., D’Andrea, J.A., & Coon, D.W. (2002). Developing interventions for male 

caregivers: Challenges and opportunities. In D.W. Coon, D. Gallagher-Thompson, & L.W. 
Thompson (Eds.), Innovative interventions to reduce dementia caregiver distress: A 
clinical guide. New York: Springer. 

 
Freed, D.M., Elder, W.W., Lauderdale, S.A., & Carter, S.R. (1999). An integrated program for 

dementia evaluation and care management. Gerontologist, 39, 356-361. 
 
Freed, D.M., Elder, W.W., Lauderdale, S.A., & Carter, S. (1998). A community approach to 

dementia care. Texas Journal on Aging, 1, 46-52. 
 

Peer-Review Presentations (* Denotes presentations with students) 
 
Lauderdale, S. A. & Lahman, K. R. (2025, February). The role of artificial intelligence 
in manifestation determination reviews [paper presentation]. National Association of 
School Psychologists. Seattle, WA. 
 
*Lauderdale, S. A., Schmitt, R., & Wieck, J. (2024, November). Artificial intelligence’s 
detection of PTSD, treatment recommendations, and public stigma for veterans [paper 
presentation]. Association of Behavioral and Cognitive Therapies. Philadelphia, PA. 

 
*Tomlinson, S. K. & Lauderdale, S. (2024, November). What AI chatbots say about 
non-suicidal self harm: Comparisons to expert factsheets. Poster presented at the annual 
meeting of the Association of Behavioral and Cognitive Therapies. Philadelphia, PA. 
 
Lahman, K. R. & Lauderdale, S. (2024, November). Mental health literacy for 
Borderline Personality Disorder through the eyes of artificial intelligence: Symptom 
recognition and treatment recommendations. Poster presented at the annual meeting of 
the Association of Behavioral and Cognitive Therapies. Philadelphia, PA. 
 
*Montoya, J., Andrade, E., Desai, H., & Lauderdale, S. (2024, November). Artificial 
intelligence's recognition of Social Anxiety Disorder and recommendations for treatment: 
A comparative study between ChatGPT-3.5 and humans. Poster presented at the annual 
meeting of the Association of Behavioral and Cognitive Therapies. Philadelphia, PA. 
 
*Andrade, E., Montoya, J. M., Lauderdale, S., Desai, H. (2024, November). Artificial 
intelligence's recognition of Generalized Anxiety Disorder and recommendations for 
treatment: A comparative study between ChatGPT-3.5 and humans. Poster presented at 
the annual meeting of the Association of Behavioral and Cognitive Therapies. 
Philadelphia, PA. 
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*Johnson, S., Helom, A., Ashford, L., Lauderdale, S. A., Van Wie, M., MacPherson, A., 
(2024, March). The association between gender role beliefs and peripartum depression 
stigma. Poster presented at the annual meeting of the Southwest Psychological 
Association. San Antonio, TX. 
 
*Santos, A., & Lauderdale, S. A. (2024, March). Comparing ChatGPT-3’s responses 
about Borderline Personality Disorder to an expert written factsheet. Poster presented at 
the annual meeting of the Southwest Psychological Association. San Antonio, TX. 
 
*Horan, T., Desai, H., Mansour, H., Ashford, L., Lauderdale, S. A., MacPherson, A., & 
Van Wie, M. (2024, March). The association between knowledge about peripartum 
depression and peripartum depression stigma. Poster presented at the annual meeting of 
the Southwest Psychological Association. San Antonio, TX. 
 
*Tomlinson, S. K., & Lauderdale, S. (2024, March). What AI chatbots say about non-
suicidal self injury: Comparison to expert factsheets. Poster presented at the annual 
meeting of the Southwest Psychological Association. San Antonio, TX. 
 
*Encalade, A., Wuckovich, B., & Lauderdale, S. (2024, March). Public stigma for 
veterans with PTSD and traumatic brain injury. Poster presented at the annual meeting of 
the Southwest Psychological Association. San Antonio, TX. 
 
*Hunter, H. & Lauderdale, S. (2024, March). Public stigma for a man veteran 
experiencing sexual assault. Poster presented at the annual meeting of the Southwest 
Psychological Association. San Antonio, TX. 
 
*Lahman, K., Messerli, M., Jackson, J., Lauderdale, S. A., Keller-Margulis, M. (2024, 
February). Shifting perfection: From enemy to ally of the good. Paper presented at the 
annual meeting of the National Association of School Psychologists. New Orleans, LA. 
 
*Desai, H., Lauderdale, S. A., & Sorocco, K. (2023, November). Hey ChatGPT! Tell me 
about Alzheimer’s Disease and caregiving! Poster presented at the annual meeting of the 
Association for Behavior and Cognitive Therapies. Seattle, WA. 
 
*Lahman, K., Santos, A., & Lauderdale, S. A. (2023, November). Tell me about 
Borderline Personality Disorder! Comparing Chatgpt-3’s responses about Borderline 
Personality Disorder to an expert-written factsheet. Poster presented at the annual 
meeting of the Association for Behavior and Cognitive Therapies. Seattle, WA. 
  
*Tomlinson, S., & Lauderdale, S. A. (2023, November). Tell me about Non-suicidal 
self-injury! Comparing ChatGPT output about NSSI to expert-written web pages. Poster 
presented at the annual meeting of the Association for Behavior and Cognitive Therapies. 
Seattle, WA. 
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*Galipp, K., & Lauderdale, S. A. (2023, November). Tell me about ADHD! Comparing 
ChatGPT output about ADHD to NIMH and ABCT factsheets. Poster presented at the 
annual meeting of the Association for Behavior and Cognitive Therapies. Seattle, WA. 
 
Lauderdale, S. A., & Daniel, R. (2023, November). Tell me about combat-PTSD! 
Comparing ChatGPT output about combat-related PTSD to the ABCT factsheet on 
military PTSD. Poster presented at the annual meeting of the Association for Behavior 
and Cognitive Therapies. Seattle, WA. 
 
Lauderdale, S. A. (2023, November). Tell me about schizophrenia! Comparing chatgpt-
3 output about schizophrenia to the NIMH and ABCT factsheets. Poster presented at the 
annual meeting of the Association for Behavior and Cognitive Therapies. Seattle, WA. 

 
Lauderdale, S., McGuire, A., Pote, L., Keifer, J., Steffan, A. M., & Sedlar, G. (2022, 
November). Addressing the needs of master level CBT clinicians across multiple 
disciplines: Education, professional training, and user centered design of intervention 
materials. Presented at the annual meeting of the Association for Behavior and Cognitive 
Therapies. New York, NY. 
 
*Wheelock, M., Lauderdale, S. A., Dunmire, S., Lahman, K., & Daniel, R. (2022, 
November). A broad reintegration scale for assessing military service members’ 
reintegration to civilian roles: The New MOS. Presented at the annual meeting of the 
Association for Behavior and Cognitive Therapies. New York, NY. 
 

*Wheelock, M., Lauderdale, S. A., Lahman, K., Daniel, R., & Dunmire, S. (2022, November). 
Perceived morally injurious behaviors are associated with less public stigma for veterans 
with combat-related PTSD. Presented at the annual meeting of the Association for 
Behavior and Cognitive Therapies. New York, NY. 

 
*Bixby Martin, A., Lauderdale, S. A., Wheelock, M., Evans, A., & Dunmire, S. (2022, 

November). Public stigma for law enforcement officers with PTSD and work stress is 
predicted by race and perception of law enforcement. Presented at the annual meeting of 
the Association for Behavior and Cognitive Therapies. New York, NY. 

 
*Bennett, J., Ball, L., Ball, S., Lauderdale, S. A., Evans, A., & Lahman, K. (2022, November). 

Parental status as a risk for combat-related PTSD in women and men military service 
members. Presented at the annual meeting of the Association for Behavior and Cognitive 
Therapies. New York, NY. 

 
*Lahman, K., & Lauderdale, S. (2022, February). Predicting manifestation determination 

outcomes from educators’ perceived racial stereotypes. Poster presentation proposed for 
the annual meeting of the National Association of School Psychologists. Boston, MA. 

  
*Lahman, K., & Lauderdale, S. (2022, February). Predicting outcomes with manifestation 

determination knowledge and perceived student intentionality. Poster presentation 
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proposed for the annual meeting of the National Association of School Psychologists. 
Boston, MA. 

  
*Hightower, H. & Lauderdale, S. (2021, November). Risk and protective factors in the 

development of COVID-19 Stress Syndrome. Presented at the annual meeting of the 
Association for Behavior and Cognitive Therapies. New Orleans, LA. 

 
*Lahman, K. & Lauderdale, S. (2021, November). Disciplinary removals of specific disability 

categories in public schools: A national trend. Presented at the annual meeting of the 
Association for Behavior and Cognitive Therapies. New Orleans, LA. 

 
*Lauderdale, S. A., Daniel, R., & Lahman, K. R. (2021, November). Perceived moral injury of 

combat veterans and association with public stigma. Presented at the annual meeting of 
the Association for Behavior and Cognitive Therapies. New Orleans, LA. 

 
*Lahman, K. & Lauderdale, S. (2021, April). Disciplinary removals in Texas urban/rural school 

districts predicted by student race. Poster presented at the annual convention of the 
Southwestern Psychological Association. San Antonio, TX. 

 
*Lahman, K. & Lauderdale, S. (2021, April). Revised subscales of the Indecisiveness Scale 

differentially predict risks for and symptoms of emotional distress. Poster presented at the 
annual convention of the Southwestern Psychological Association. San Antonio, TX. 

 
*Lauderdale, S., & Daniel, R. (2020, November). Public stigma for men and women veterans 

with combat-PTSD [conference presentation]. Presented at the annual meeting of the 
Association for Behavior and Cognitive Therapies. Philadelphia, PA. 

 
*Lauderdale, S., & Daniel, R. (2020, November). Stigma for a woman veteran experiencing 

military sexual trauma [conference presentation]. Presented at the annual meeting of the 
Association for Behavior and Cognitive Therapies. Philadelphia, PA. 

 
Lauderdale, S. (Chair, 2020, November). Assessing the Damage of Stigma: A Comprehensive 

Evaluation of Variables Affecting Public and Internalized Stigma Experienced by Active 
Duty Service Members and Veterans [symposium]. Presented at the annual meeting of the 
Association for Behavior and Cognitive Therapies. Philadelphia, PA. 

 
*Lauderdale, S., & Lahman, K. (2020, November). Thoughts about past and future negative 

experiences and emotions incrementally predicts depression over cognitive 
vulnerabilities. Poster presented at the annual meeting of the Association for Behavior 
and Cognitive Therapies. Philadelphia, PA. 

 
*Lauderdale, S., & Lahman, K. (2020, November). Thoughts about past and future negative 

experiences and emotions incrementally predicts anxiety over cognitive vulnerabilities. 
Poster presented at the annual meeting of the Association for Behavior and Cognitive 
Therapies. Philadelphia, PA. 
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*Hernandez, C., & Lauderdale, S.A. (2020, November). Mental health stigma and trauma in 
Latino/as. Poster presented at the annual meeting of the Association for Behavior and 
Cognitive Therapies. Philadelphia, PA. 

 
*Kaip, T., Roach, J., Jones, B., Daniel, R., & Lauderdale, S. (2020, October). A description of 

the North Texas Regional Veterans’ Court (NTRVC). Poster presented at the annual 
meeting of the Combat-PTSD Conference. San Antonio, TX. 

 
*Hernandez, C., & Lauderdale, S.A. (2020, October). Mental health stigma and trauma in 

Latino/as. Poster presented at the annual meeting of the National Latino Psychological 
Association. Virtual. 

 
*Daniel, R., Lauderdale, S., Christian, K., Lahman, K. (2020, October). The New MOS: A 

broad reintegration scale for assessing active duty service members’ reintegration to 
civilian roles. Poster presented at the annual meeting of the Combat-PTSD Conference. 
San Antonio, TX. 

 
*Daniel, R., Lauderdale, S., McGuire, A., Lahman, K., Christian, K., (2020, October). Public 

stigma for a male veteran experiencing military sexual trauma. Poster presented at the 
annual meeting of the Combat-PTSD Conference. San Antonio, TX. 

 
*Daniel, R., Lauderdale, S., Christian, K., Lahman, K. (2020, October). Public stigma for a 

woman veteran experiencing military sexual trauma. Poster presented at the annual 
meeting of the Combat-PTSD Conference. San Antonio, TX. 

 
*Ely, M., Lipscomb, T., Gray, D., Hallmark, H., Roach, J., Jones, B., Ely, L., Daniel, R., & 

Lauderdale, S. (2020, October). Preliminary outcomes of Veterans Accessing Lifelong 
Opportunities for Rehabilitation (VALOR) Program: A correctional therapeutic 
community program for justice involved veterans. Poster presented at the annual meeting 
of the Combat-PTSD Conference. San Antonio, TX. 

 
*Martin, K., Lauderdale, S., Thorpe, S., & Mohlman, J. (2019, November). Psychometric 

properties of the Older Adult Technophobia Scale and Smartphone Challenge Task. 
Poster presented at the annual meeting of the Gerontological Society of America. Austin, 
TX. 

 
*Lauderdale, S. A., & Ashford, L. (2019, November). New Aversive Indecisiveness and 

Positive Beliefs About Decision Making scales are differentially predictive of risks for 
and symptoms of anxiety and depression. Poster presented at the annual meeting of the 
Association for Behavior and Cognitive Therapies. Atlanta, GA. 

 
*Moore, J., Martin, K., & Lauderdale, S. A. (2019, November). Exploratory and confirmatory 

factor analysis of the Revised Indecisiveness Scale. Poster presented at the annual 
meeting of the Association for Behavior and Cognitive Therapies. Atlanta, GA. 
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*Daniel, R., Ely, L., & Lauderdale, S.A. (2019, November). A comparison of public stigma for 
veterans with combat related PTSD and traumatic brain injury to veterans with combat 
related PTSD. Poster presented at the annual meeting of the Association for Behavior and 
Cognitive Therapies. Atlanta, GA. 

 
*Daniel, R., Lauderdale, S. A., Ely, L. (2019, November). Public stigma for women and men 

veterans: Empathy, gender role beliefs, and veteran control. Poster presented at the 
annual meeting of the Association for Behavior and Cognitive Therapies. Atlanta, GA. 

 
*Lauderdale, S.A., Daniel, R., Ballotti, R.J., Whitworth, S., & Hall, J. (2019, October). A 

comparison of public stigma for veterans with combat-related PTSD and traumatic brain 
injury to veterans with combat-related PTSD. Poster presented at the annual meeting of 
the Combat-PTSD Conference. San Antonio, TX. 

 
*Daniel, R., Lauderdale, S.A., Ballotti, R.J., Hall, J., & Whitworth, S. (2019, October). Public 

stigma for women and men veterans is predicted by participant gender, perceived veteran 
gender, perceived veteran control, beliefs about causes of mental disorders, 
veteran familiarity, and participants’ Trauma Symptoms. Poster presented at the annual 
meeting of the Combat-PTSD Conference. San Antonio, TX.  

 
*Lauderdale, S., Daniel, R., & Ely, L. (2019, October). Initial development of the All Veterans 

Reintegration Questionnaire. Poster presented at the annual meeting of the Combat-PTSD 
Conference. San Antonio, TX.  

 
*Lauderdale, S., Daniel, R., & Caldwell, H. (2018, November). Assumptive world beliefs 

predicts public stigma for men and women veterans with combat-related PTSD. Poster 
presented at the annual meeting of the Association for Behavior and Cognitive Therapies. 
Washington, DC. 

 
*Oakes, K., Ballotti, R. J., Moore, J., Martin, K., & Lauderdale, S. (2018, November). Aversive 

indecisiveness is a transdiagnostic process for anxiety and depression. Poster presented at 
the annual meeting of the Association for Behavior and Cognitive Therapies. 
Washington, DC. 

 
*Moore, J., Martin, K., Oakes, K., Ballotti, R. J., & Lauderdale, S. (2018, November). 

Confirmatory factor analysis of the Revised Indecisiveness Scale. Poster presented at the 
annual meeting of the Association for Behavior and Cognitive Therapies. Washington, 
DC. 

 
*Martin, K., Moore, J., Oakes, K., Ballotti, R. J., Daniel, R., & Lauderdale, S. (2018, 

November). Anti-depressant direct-to-consumer advertising: Predictors of attitudes and 
behavioral intent towards antidepressant medications. Poster presented at the annual 
meeting of the Association for Behavior and Cognitive Therapies. Washington, DC. 
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*Lauderdale, S., & Daniels, R. (2018, October). Public stigma for men and women veterans 
with combat-related PTSD. Poster presented at the annual meeting of the San Antonio 
Combat PTSD Conference. San Antonio, TX. 

 
*Caldwell, H. & Lauderdale, S. (2017, November). Stigmatizing attitudes towards men and 

women veterans with combat-related PTSD. Poster presented at the annual meeting of the 
Association of Behavioral and Cognitive Therapies. San Diego, CA. 

 
Lauderdale, S. (2017, November). Evaluating the distinction between aversive indecisiveness 

and procrastination: Relationships with anxiety, anxiety vulnerability, and personality 
traits. Poster presented at the annual meeting of the Association of Behavioral and 
Cognitive Therapies. San Diego, CA. 

 
Lauderdale, S. (2017, November). Further evidence that aversive indecisiveness is an anxiety 

process: Unique associations with uncertainty dimensions and partial mediation of the 
relationship between inhibitory uncertainty and worry. Poster presented at the annual 
meeting of the Association of Behavioral and Cognitive Therapies. San Diego, CA. 

 
Lauderdale, S. (2017, November). Decomposing the Looming Cognitive Style: Perception of 

threat probability, progression, and visualization with anxiety, worry, and GAD 
symptoms. Poster presented at the annual meeting of the Association of Behavioral and 
Cognitive Therapies. San Diego, CA. 

 
Lauderdale, S. (2017, November). Effect of etiological beliefs, dysfunctional attitudes, 

depressive experiences, and exposure to antidepressant drug commercial on attitudes and 
intention to seek antidepressant medication. Poster presented at the annual meeting of the 
Association of Behavioral and Cognitive Therapies. San Diego, CA. 

 
*Lauderdale, S., & Rennie, K. (2016, October). 

Mediation of aversive indecisiveness and worry by cognitive vulnerability for anxiety. 
Poster presented at the annual meeting of the Association of Behavioral and Cognitive 
Therapies. New York, New York. 

 
*Lauderdale, S., Rennie, K., & Smith, C. (2014, November). 
Attention control mediates neuroticism and various avoidance strategies. Poster presented at the 

annual meeting of the Association of Behavioral and Cognitive Therapies. Philadelphia, 
PA. 

 
*Lauderdale, S., Rennie, K., & Smith, C. (2014 November). 
Intolerance of uncertainty and looming cognitive style mediates attention control and avoidance. 

Poster presented at the annual meeting of the Association of Behavioral and Cognitive 
Therapies. Philadelphia, PA. 

 
*Lauderdale, S., & Nelson, K. (2014, November). “I need that!” Participant characteristics 

associated with attitudes and intention to use an antidepressant after exposure to televised 
direct to consumer advertisement. Poster presented at the annual meeting of the 
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Association of Behavioral and Cognitive Therapies. Philadelphia, PA. 
 
*Smith, S., Lauderdale, S., & Elliot, A. (2012, March). Correlates of the MMPI2-RF's 

Interpersonal Passivity Scale (IPP). Poster presented at the annual meeting of the Society 
for Personality Assessment. 

  
Cassidy-Eagle, E., Lauderdale, S., Glassman, J., Beaudreau, S., 

O’Hara, R. (2011, November). Sleep and cognitive functioning of older adults in 
residential care. Poster presented at the annual meeting of the Association for Behavioral 
and Cognitive Therapies, Toronto, Canada. 

 
Lauderdale, S. A. (2010, November). Psychometric properties of the Future Oriented and 

Generalized Looming Cognitive Style Questionnaire. Poster presented at the annual 
meeting of the Association for Behavioral and Cognitive Therapies, San Francisco, CA. 

 
Denny, S., Wilkins, J., & Lauderdale, S. A. (2010, November). Effect of a community based 

treatment program on rural elders’ perceived physical and mental health. Poster presented 
at the annual meeting of the Association for Behavioral and Cognitive Therapies, San 
Francisco, CA. 

 
*Smith, J.V., Lauderdale, S.A., & Sanker, S. (2010, March). Reported coping styles associated 

with the MMPI-20-RF’s Inefficacy Scale. Poster presented at the annual meeting of the 
Society for Personality Assessment, San Jose, CA. 

 
Lauderdale, S.A. (2009). Are we okay? Interrelationship of attachment, looming, doubt in 

others, reassurance seeking, and GAD. Poster presented at the annual meeting of the 
Association for Behavioral and Cognitive Therapies, New York, NY. 

 
Lauderdale, S.A. (2008, November). Relationship between Physiological anxiety, cognitive 

avoidance, looming, and anxiety sensitivity. Poster presented at the annual meeting of the 
Association for Behavioral and Cognitive Therapies, Orlando, FL. 

 
Lauderdale, S.A., Hyatt, K., Harris, J.I., Erbes, C., Engdahl, B., & Olson, R. (2008, November). 

Posttraumatic growth, prayer coping, and perceived health of older adults. Poster 
presented at the annual meeting of the Association for Behavioral and Cognitive 
Therapies, Orlando, FL. 

 
*Lauderdale, S.A., & Hefel, J. (2007, November). Interaction of looming cognitive style, 

intolerance of uncertainty, and GAD. Poster presented at the annual meeting of the 
Association for Behavioral and Cognitive Therapies, Philadelphia, PA. 

 
Lauderdale, S.A., & Hefel, J. (2007, November). Reports of emotional symptoms by older ALF 

residents and staff. Poster presented at the annual meeting of the Association for 
Behavioral and Cognitive Therapies, Philadelphia, PA. 
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*Hefel, J., & Lauderdale, S.A. (2007, November). Association of frequency and intent to 
exercise with anxiety sensitivity in individuals with panic symptoms. Poster presented at 
the annual meeting of the Association for Behavioral and Cognitive Therapies, 
Philadelphia, PA. 

 
Lauderdale, S.A. (2007, November). Association between specific traumatic symptoms, 

posttraumatic growth, and prayers in older adults. Poster presented at the annual meeting 
of the Association for Behavioral and Cognitive Therapies, Philadelphia, PA. 

 
Lauderdale, S.A. (2007, November). Relationship between physiological anxiety, cognitive 

avoidance, looming, and anxiety sensitivity. Poster presented at the annual meeting of the 
Association for Behavioral and Cognitive Therapies, Philadelphia, PA. 

 
Lauderdale, S.A. (2007, November). Prayer coping of family members of people with dementia. 

Paper presented at the annual Alzheimer’s Research Forum of the Alzheimer’s 
Association, Heart of America Chapter, Kansas City, KS. 

 
Lauderdale, S.A. (2007, August). Mediation of religious coping style and mental wellbeing by 

prayers. Poster presented at the annual meeting of the American Psychological 
Association, San Francisco, CA. 

 
Lauderdale, S.A., Harris, J.I., Erbes, C., Engdahl, B., & Olson, R. (2007, August). Mediation of 

religious beliefs and posttraumatic growth by prayers. Poster presented at the annual 
meeting of the American Psychological Association, San Francisco, CA. 

 
Lauderdale, S.A. (2007, March). ALF residents’ reports of facility satisfaction, anxiety, 

depression, cognitive impairment, and perceived barriers to health care. Paper presented 
at the annual joint meeting of National Council on Aging and the American Society of 
Aging, Chicago, Ill. 

 
*Lauderdale, S.A. Hefel, J., Harris, J.I., Erbes, C.R., Engdahl, B., & Olson, R.H. (2006, 

November). The prediction of posttraumatic growth by religious coping and prayer in 
older adults. Poster presented at the annual meeting of the Association for Behavioral and 
Cognitive Therapies, Chicago, Ill. 

 
*Lauderdale, S.A., & Hefel, J. (2006, November). Assessing the unique variance of GAD 

explained by looming maladaptive style and intolerance of uncertainty. Poster presented 
at the annual meeting of the Association for Behavioral and Cognitive Therapies, 
Chicago, Ill. 

 
Lauderdale, S.A. (2006, August). Dementia caregivers’ prayer type use, coping, burden, and 

depression. Poster presented at the annual meeting of the American Psychological 
Association, New Orleans, LA. 
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Lauderdale, S.A. (2006, August). Using Repeated Measurement to Tailor Interventions for 
Depressed Family Caregivers. Paper presented at the annual meeting of the American 
Psychological Association, New Orleans, LA. 

 
Lauderdale, S.A., & Cassidy, E.L. (2005, November). Frequency of Anxiety, Depression, and 

Cognitive Impairment in Older ALF Residents: Staff Recognition and Residents’ 
Perceived Barriers to Care. Paper presented at the annual meeting of the Association for 
Cognitive and Behavioral Therapies, Washington, DC. 

 
Lauderdale, S.A., & Sorocco, K.A. (2005, November). Dementia family caregivers’ prayer type 

use: Association with religious and non-religious coping strategies, burden, and 
depression. Poster presented at the annual meeting of the Association for Cognitive and 
Behavioral Therapies, Washington, DC. 

 
*Larson, T., & Lauderdale, S.A. (2005, August). Relationship between prayer type use, 

religious problem solving orientation, and depression and anxiety. Poster presented at the 
annual meeting of the American Psychological Association, Washington DC. 

 
*Cassidy, E.L., Kelly, K., Lauderdale, S.A., O’Hara, R., Sheikh, J.I. (2004, November). 

Combining research and practice to increase use of behavioral strategies in assisted living 
facilities. Paper presented at the annual meeting of the Association for the Advancement 
of Behavior Therapy, New Orleans, LA. 

 
Lauderdale, S.A. & Sorocco, K.H. (2004, November). Men providing care: Current state of 

knowledge and future directions. Poster presented at the annual meeting of the 
Association for the Advance of Behavior Therapy, New Orleans, LA. 

 
Spira, A.P., Coon, D.W., Lauderdale, S.A., & Gallagher-Thompson, D. (2004, November). 

Impact of dementia caregiver interventions on rates of institutionalization. Poster 
presented at the annual meeting of the Association for the Advance of Behavior Therapy, 
New Orleans, LA. 

 
Lauderdale, S.A. (2004, November). Diversity’s role in expanding clinical practice. Panelist for 

clinical roundtable at the annual meeting of the Association for the Advance of Behavior 
Therapy, New Orleans, LA. 

 
Mumma, G.H., Mooney, S. R., & Lauderdale, S.A. (2004, August). Testing intraindividual 

dimensional structure using confirmatory dynamic factor analysis. Poster presented at the 
annual meeting of the American Psychological Association, Honolulu, HI. 

 
Cassidy, E. L., Kelly, K., Lauderdale, S., Powers, R., McGee, J., & Sheikh, J. (2004, February). 

Assisted living facilities: The new frontier in dementia care. Poster presented at the 
annual meeting of the American Association for Geriatric Psychiatry, Baltimore, MD. 

 
Coon, D. W., Lauderdale, S., Gray, H., Thompson, L.W., & Gallagher-Thompson, D. (2003, 

November). Coping with Caregiving: Psychosocial interventions with Latina and 
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Caucasian female dementia caregivers. Poster presented at the Gerontological Society of 
American Annual Meeting, San Diego, CA. 

 
Carlson, E., Lauderdale, S.A., & Sheik, J.I. (2003, November). Aggression and PTSD 

symptoms in nursing home care patients. Poster presented at the Association for 
Advancement of Behavior Therapy, Boston, MA. 

 
Kelly, K., Cassidy, E., Lauderdale, S.A., & Sheikh, J.I. (2003, November). Efficacy of 

behavioral training program in dementia at an assisted living facility. Poster presented at 
the Association for Advancement of Behavior Therapy, Boston, MA. 

 
Lauderdale, S.A. & Mumma, G.H. (2003, November). Multivariate, replicated, single-subject 

repeated measures designs: How daily processes can inform clinical practice. Panel 
discussion presented at the Association for Advancement of Behavior Therapy, Boston, 
MA. 

 
Lauderdale, S.A., Wang, P.C., & D’Andrea, J. (2003). Tailoring caregiving interventions to 

caregiving men from diverse cultural backgrounds. Paper presented at the American 
Psychological Association’s National Multicultural and Conference Summit, Hollywood, 
CA. 

 
Lauderdale, S.A., Mumma, G.H., Mooney, S., & Riggens, J. (2002, November). Intra-

individual dimensional structure and discriminant validity of subjective caregiver burden 
and depression. Poster presented at the annual convention of the Association for 
Advancement of Behavior Therapy, Reno, NV. 

 
Cassidy, E. L., Rosen, C., Lauderdale, S.A., & Sheikh, J.I. (2002, November). Assessment to 

intervention: Utilizing a staff needs assessment to improve care for behaviorally 
challenging patients in long-term care. Paper presented at the annual convention of the 
Association for Advancement of Behavior Therapy, Reno, NV. 

 
Lauderdale, S.A., D’Andrea, J., McCallum, T.J., Coon, D., & Gallagher-Thompson, D. (2001, 

August). Pilot study of a psychoeducational intervention for male caregivers. Paper 
presented at the annual convention of the American Psychological Association, San 
Francisco, CA. 

 
Lauderdale, S.A., Mausbach, B., Coon, D., & Gallagher-Thompson, D. (2001, August). Coping 

with caregiving: changes in Caucasian and Latina coping strategies. Poster presented at 
the annual convention of the American Psychological Association, San Francisco, CA. 

 
Carter, S., Freed, D.M., Elder, W.W., Lauderdale, S.A., & Harter, S.L. (1998). Evaluating the 

utility of an informant based interview for dementia of the Alzheimer’s type. Poster 
presented at the annual meeting of the National Academy of Neuropsychology, 
Washington, DC. 
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Lauderdale, S.A., & Cook, S. W. (1998, August). The relations among prayer types, coping, and 
psychological health [paper presentation]. American Psychological Association, San 
Francisco, CA. 

 
Reviewer & Editor Activities 
 
2024: Review & Super Reviewer: Association for Behavioral and Cognitive Therapies annual                     
convention 

2024: Review & Super Reviewer: Southwest Psychological Association annual convention 
2023-present: Invited reviewer: JMIR Mental Health 

2023: Review & Super Reviewer: Southwest Psychological Association annual convention 
2023: Review & Super Reviewer: Association for Behavioral and Cognitive Therapies annual                     
convention 
2023-present: Invited reviewer: International Journal of Evidence-Based Coaching and 

Mentoring. 
2022-present: Invited reviewer: Psychological Reports 
2022-present: Invited reviewer: Current Psychology 
2020-present: Invited reviewer: International Journal of Cognitive Therapy 
2020-present: Invited reviewer: Frontiers in Psychology 
2019-present: Invited reviewer: Personality and Individual Differences 
2019-present: Invited reviewer: Cognitive Therapy and Research 
2019: Review & Super Reviewer: Association for Behavioral and Cognitive Therapies annual 

convention 
2018-present: Guest Editor: Cognitive and Behavior Therapy 
2018: Review & Super Reviewer: Association for Behavioral and Cognitive Therapies annual 

convention 
2018-present: Invited reviewer: International Journal of Cognitive Therapy 
2017: Review & Super Reviewer: Association for Behavioral and Cognitive Therapies annual 

convention 
2017: Invited reviewer: International Psychogeriatrics 
2015: Invited reviewer: Cognitive and Behavioral Practice 
2012: Invited grant reviewer: Alzheimer’s Society, United Kingdom 2009 

Invited reviewer: Journal of Pain and Symptom Management  
2005: Invited reviewer: Therapy 
2004: Invited reviewer: Psychosomatics  
2003: Invited reviewer: Clinical Gerontologist 
 
Research Activities 
2013-present: Anxiety and Depression Research  

Time perspectives and anxiety: Various research groups have examined how participants’ 
time perspectives about negative events and emotions are associated with risk for anxiety 
and depression. In their current project, Dr. Lauderdale and his lab are investigating 
which of these perspectives are better a predicting cognitive risks for and symptoms of 
anxiety and depression. 

2013-present: Indecisiveness Research 
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Indecisiveness has long been recognized as a symptom of several mental disorders, 
including Major Depressive Disorder, Obsessive-Compulsive Disorder, and Hoarding. 
Dr. Lauderdale and his lab were the first to publish research demonstrating that Aversive 
Indecisiveness, a dispositional form of indecisiveness associated with negative 
expectations about decision-making, was uniquely predictive of risks for and symptoms 
of anxiety and depression. In on-going projects, Dr. Lauderdale’s lab has revaluated a 
measure of indecisiveness to evaluate the underlying factor structure. Dr. Lauderdale’s 
lab also has data demonstrating that indecisiveness is distinct from other related 
constructs, such as procrastination. Current projects are assessing other cognitive factors 
associated with indecisiveness, such as perfectionism, fear of guilt, and fear of failure. 
Finally, Dr. Lauderdale and his lab have added new items to the revised Indecisiveness 
Scale to address limitations of the measure. Preliminary findings with over 400 
participants indicates this measure improves on the prediction of cognitive risks for and 
symptoms of anxiety and depression. 
 

2015-present: Veteran Research 
 

Public Stigma: Few researchers have examined public stigma for veterans. In a series of 
projects, Dr. Lauderdale and his lab are examining various factors associated with public 
stigma for men and women veterans with combat-related PTSD (CR-PTSD). Recent 
projects include evaluating gender differences in stigma for men and women with CR-
PTSD. Data is also being collected to determine how perceived control over exposure to 
CR-PTSD may influence stigma. Other variables being examined include gender role 
beliefs, empathy, and participants’ experience with PTSD. 
New projects underway include evaluation of how traumatic brain injury (TBI) may 
influence stigma. TBI is considered a major factor affecting veterans of OIF/OEF/OND, 
with over 25% of veterans experiencing TBI. No research has yet examined whether a 
veteran with TBI+CR-PTSD experiences more stigma than a veteran with CR-PTSD. 
Results could have implications for prejudice and discrimination. 
Military Sexual Trauma: Military sexual trauma (MST) of women and men has persisted 
at a high rate for many decades. Research has yet to evaluate the public’s perspective of 
veterans with MST. This project has received IRB approval and data collection is 
pending. 
Transition from the military, NEW MOS: Few measures have been developed to quantify 
challenges experienced by veterans following military separation. Based on a review of 
the scant literature available, Dr. Lauderdale and his lab have constructed a preliminary 
scale that could be used to quantify veterans’ experience of military separation. Results 
could have implications for helping veterans and service providers manage military 
separation. 
Program Evaluation, North Texas Regional Veterans Court: Dr. Lauderdale and his lab 
have been selected to provide program evaluation services for the only regional (spanning 
five counties in north east Texas) veterans’ court in the United States. Our data will be 
used to train other criminal justice professionals (e.g., judges, probation officers, court 
coordinators) to establish regional veterans’ courts in other Texas counties and states. 
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2018-present: Older Adults and Technophobia 
 

In collaboration with other researchers, Dr. Lauderdale and his lab are examining the 
psychometric properties of two innovative measures: a technophobia scale and 
smartphone challenge task for older adults. Preliminary evidence suggest the 
technophobia scale and smartphone challenge task have excellent internal consistency 
and concurrent validity. 
 

2019-present: Other research on-going in lab: 
Scarlett Dunmire: Association between complementary and alternative medicine use, 
depression, anxiety, and rejection by medical professionals. 
Megan Wheelock: Public stigma by veterans for other veterans experiencing military 
sexual trauma. 
Kelli Lahman: Predictors of Educators’ Manifest Determination Decisions: Perceived 
Ethnic Traits, Manifest Determination Knowledge, Perceived Controllability, and 
Perceived Recognition of Consequences. 
Hannah Hightower: Coping and cognitive vulnerabilities as mediators of anxiety and 
stress in response to COVID-19. 
Annmarie Martin: Public stigma for first responders experiencing PTSD. 
Cassandra Hernandez: Public stigma for Hispanic victims of racially motivated mass 
shootings compared to public stigma for Hispanic victims of non-racially motivated 
shootings. 
Krystal Caldwell: Gender difference between women and men in cyberstalking activities. 
 

2015-present: Consumer Response to Antidepressant Medications 
 

In this on-going project, Dr. Lauderdale and his lab are exploring variables that may 
predict consumer responsiveness to commercials for antidepressant commercials. 
This innovative project focuses on risks including: depressive symptoms, cognitive 
risks for depression, beliefs about causes of mental disorders, and familiarity with 
people who have depression. 

 
2001-2003: Postdoctoral Research Fellow, Aging Treatment Studies Program, VA Palo Alto 

Health Care System. Supervisors: Erin L. Cassidy, Ph.D., and Javaid I. Sheikh, M.D. 
 
2000-2001: Geropsychology Intern-Older Adult and Family Center, VA Palo Alto Health Care 

System in collaboration with the Stanford University School of Medicine. 
Supervisors: Dolores Gallagher-Thompson, Ph.D., Larry Thompson, Ph.D., David 
Coon, Ph.D., and James D’Andrea, Ph.D. 

 
1999-2002: Dissertation, Division of Clinical Psychology, Department of Psychology, Texas Tech 

University. Title: Intraindividual Dimensional Structure and Discriminant Validity of 
Subjective Caregiver Burden and Depression. Supervisor: Gregory H. Mumma, Ph.D. 

 
1996-1999: Research Assistant\Dementia Screening Clinic Coordinator-Alzheimer’s Disease 

Education Program (sponsored by a grant from Robert Wood Johnson Foundation), 
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Neuropsychology Services, Department of Neuropsychiatry and Behavioral 
Sciences, Texas Tech University Health Sciences Center Supervisors: David M. 
Freed, Ph.D., and Stephanie L. Harter, Ph.D. 

 
1998-1999: Research Assistant\Care Manager-Alzheimer Care Service/Alzheimer’s Disease 

Education Program, Neuropsychology Services, Department of Neuropsychiatry and 
Behavioral Sciences, Texas Tech University Health Sciences Center. Supervisors: 
David M. Freed, Ph.D., and Wes Elder, M.A. 

 
1997-1998: Co-Investigator/Research Therapist-Research Project: Efficacy of Formulation-

Based Psychotherapy for Depressed Caregivers of Patients with Alzheimer’s 
Disease. Texas Tech University Psychology Department, Division of Clinical 
Psychology in conjunction with the Texas Tech University Health Sciences Center 
Alzheimer’s Disease Education Program, Department of Neuropsychiatry and 
Behavioral Sciences. Supervisors: David M. Freed, Ph.D., Gregory H. Mumma, 
Ph.D. 

 
1997-1998: Master’s Level Research Project, Department of Psychology, Texas Tech University. 

Title: The Relations Among Prayer Types, Coping, and Psychological Health. 
Supervisor: Stephan Cook, Ph.D. 

 
1994-1995: Senior Honors Thesis, Department of Psychology, School of Human Development, 

University of Texas at Dallas. Title: A Comparison of Script and Non-script Stories: 
Assessing the Influence of Causal Relations in Text. Supervisor: Melanie M. 
Spence, Ph.D. 

 
1993-1994: Research Assistant-Neurophysiology Laboratory, Department of Psychology, School 

of Human Development, University of Texas at Dallas. Supervisor: Christopher 
Fredrickson, Ph.D. 

 
Teaching Experience 
2003-present: Undergraduate 

General Psychology  
Lifespan Development 
Ethics in the Helping Professions 
Abnormal Psychology  
Research Methods I (Statistics) 
Research Methods II (Research design & advanced statistics) 
Physiological Psychology/Brain & Behavior  
Psychology of Aging  
Interdisciplinary Introduction to Aging  
Introduction to Clinical Psychology  
Criminal Psychopathology  
Forensic Psychology 

 
Graduate 
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Introduction to Human Neuropsychology 
Psychopathology and Diagnosis  
Personality Assessment 
Child Personality Assessment 
Evidence-Based Interventions-Children 
Evidence-Based Interventions-Groups 
Cognitive-Behavioral Therapy 
Ethical Issues in Clinical Psychology 
Psychopharmacology 
Neuropsychological Disorders and Screening 
Evidence-Based Supervision 
Assessment and Treatment of Substance Use Disorders 

 
Teaching Recognition 
2020: Nominated and awarded Chuck Arize Junior Faculty Award 
 
Service Activities 
2016-present: A&M-Commerce 

Department Assignments 
Interim Head, Department of Psychology and Special Education (2020-present) 
Assistant Head, Department of Psychology and Special Education (2017-present) 
Coordinator, Master of Science in Psychology (Applied/Clinical) (2019-present) 
Director, Community Psychology Clinic (2019-2021) 
Advisor, Psychology of Aging and Positive Gerontology Graduate Certificate 
(2019) 
Coordinator, MPCAC Re-accreditation Visit (Spring 2019) 
 
Department Committees 
Chair, Psychology and Special Education Appeals Committee (2017-2021)  
Member, Executive Council (2017-2021) 
Member, Master in Psychology (Applied/Clinical) (2016-present) 
Member, Undergraduate/Graduate Psychology Committee 
 
Thesis/Dissertations 
Chair, Master’s Thesis, Kelli Lahman (2020) 
Chair, Master’s Thesis, Hannah Hightower (2020) 
Chair, Honors Thesis, Chloe Ross (2020) 
Chair, Honors Thesis, Bayleigh Burling (2019-present) 
Chair, Honors Thesis, Karria Thurmond (2019) 
Chair, Master’s Thesis, Annmarie Martin (2019-present) 
Chair, Master’s Thesis, Krystal Caldwell (2019-present) 
Member, Master’s Thesis, Kiana Holmes (2019-present) 
Member, Master’s Thesis, Nina Malviya (2019-2020) 
Member, Dissertation, Kristopher Wood (2019) 
Member, Dissertation, Angie Proctor (2018) 
Member, Honors Thesis, Cindy Mays (2016) 
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Recruiting Activities 
Moderator, TAMUC College of Education and Human Services Virtual 
Recruiting Fair 
Coordinator, Careers in Psychology, TAMUC (2019-2020) 
Presenter, Clinical Psychology as a Career and Getting Into Graduate School 
TAMUC (2019) 
Presenter, Clinical Psychology as a Career and Getting Into Graduate School 
TAMUC-CHEC (2019) 
Presenter, Virtual Graduate Fair (2019) 
Graduate Student Recruiting Fair (Annually at TAMU-Commerce and TAMUC-
Metroplex) 
New/Transfer Student Orientation (Six sessions; 2016-2020) 
Presenter, NETCAT: Presentation to 8th graders attending TAMUC (2018) 
 
Other Activities 
Coordinator Invited Address by Mr. Mike Gallagher Alumni ‘66, Veteran Re-
integration and Need for Special Educators (2020) 
Coordinator Invited Address by Dr. Jeff Wherry, Evidence-based Assessment and 
Treatment of Child Sexual Abuse Survivors (2020) 
Coordinator Invited Address by Ms. Misty Ely, Military Culture Workshop 
(2019) 
DSM-5 Workshop: Presented for all graduate students in the Master of 
Psychology (Applied) (2019) 
Department of Psychology and Special Education GA Education (2018) 
Distinguished Alumni Recognition (2018) 
Presented research at Faculty Brownbag (Annually) 
 
College 
Member, Dallas County Community College Pathways Program (2019) 
Member, Paris Junior College Pathways Conference (2017) 
 
University 
Faculty Development Leave Committee (2016-2019) 
Student Veterans' Association & Veterans’ Memorial (2016-2019) 
Judge, TAMUC Graduate Student Research Symposium (2018-2019) 
Judge, Graduate Student Research Symposium, Federation of North Texas Area 
Universities (2019) 
 
Membership and Involvement in Professional Associations 
 
Association for Behavioral and Cognitive Therapies 
Annual Convention Program Super Reviewer: Reviewed abstracts for posters and 
symposia to be presented at the annual convention (2016-2019) 
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Co-Leader, Aging and Behavioral and Cognitive Therapies Special Interest Group 
(2016-present): Activities include coordinating presentations at annual conference 
and annual meeting 
 
Veteran Representative, Military and Veterans Special Interest Group (2022-
present) 
 
Masters in Psychology and Counseling Accreditation Council  
Training for Site Visit Evaluator (2018) 
 

Service Recognition 
2020: Nominated Neill Humfeld Distinguished Faculty Award for Service 

 
2003-2016: Pittsburg State University 

Department Committees 
Acting Chair, Department of Psychology and Counseling 
Clinical Council 
Chair, Institutional Review Board Committee 
Undergraduate Curriculum Committee 
Graduate Student Competency Committee 

 Practicum\Internship Committee 
 Fieldwork Selection Committee 

Educational Outcome Assessment Committee 
Faculty Search Committee (as chair and member on multiple searches) 
Chair, General Psychology Committee 
 
Master Degree Committee Memberships 

 Betty Seeley (2008, School of Nursing) 
 Mica Rosenow (2014, Health, Human Performance, and Recreation) 
 Tyler Polshak (2014, Psychology and Counseling) 
 

Master Theses Directed 
Jennifer Hefel (2008). Relationship between exercise, mental health, and anxiety 
sensitivity in young adults with panic and social anxiety symptoms. 
Katherine Overman (2009). The relationship between cognitive distortions, trust, 
and self-disclosures in the romantic relationships of childhood sexual abuse 
survivors. 
Sara K. Puckett (2009). Men and women’s awareness of risk for HPV and 
psychological reactions. 
Kenisha Nelson (2010). Direct-to-consumer advertising: A study of the effect on 
attitude towards antidepressant medication and behavioral intentions. 
Evan Adams (2012). Academic anxiety. 
Chloe Moushey (2012). Women trauma survivors’ participation in obstetrics and 
gynecological examinations. 
Paige Boydston (2014). Effect of perception of autism on participation in a parent 
training program.* 
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Jesse Henderson (2014). Development of a staff administered anxiety reduction 
group for older adults in assisted living. 
Heather Caldwell (2014): Public stigma for men and women veterans with PTSD. 
 
*Ms. Boydston was the recipient of the Graduate Poster award at the 2014 
Pittsburg State University Undergraduate and Graduate Research Colloquium. 
Ms. Boydston also presented her research at the 2014 Graduate Research Day at 
the Kansas State Capitol Building in Topeka, KS.  
 
Undergraduate Research Projects Directed 
Katie Rennie (2014). Intolerance of uncertainty and looming cognitive style 
mediates attention control and avoidance.* 
Carl Smith (2014). Attention control does not mediate the relationship between 
neuroticism and various avoidance strategies. 
JoAnna Dieker (2014). Needs assessment of home-bound people with dementia 
and their caregivers. 
 
*Ms. Rennie was the recipient of the Undergraduate Poster award at the 2014 
Pittsburg State University Undergraduate and Graduate Research Colloquium.  
 
University and College Committees 
Chair, President’s Council on Aging 
Board of Governors, Jack Overman Student Center 
Faculty Senate Executive Committee 
Faculty Senate, Budget Committee 
College of Education Promotion Committee 
Chair and adviser, Interdisciplinary Gerontology Minor 
Faculty Senate, General Education Committee 
Undergraduate Research Advisory Committee 
College of Education Assessment Committee 
Graduate and Continuing Studies Council 
Faculty Affairs Committee 
Graduate and Continuing Studies Dean Search 
Graduate Faculty Senate 
University Promotion Committee 
Open Educational Resource-Kaleidoscope Project 

   
 Other University Service 

Director, Older Adult Screening and Intervention Services (OASIS), which 
provides low cost dementia screening to older adults in the Southeast Kansas 
Region. Services are provided by closely supervised graduate students 
Judge, Graduate Research Colloquium 

 
 

 
Supervised Clinical Experience 
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2000-2001: Geropsychology Intern, Older Adult and Family Center, VA Palo Alto Health Care 

System, Palo Alto, CA. Supervisors: Dolores Gallagher-Thompson, Ph.D., Larry 
Thompson, Ph.D., and James D’Andrea, Ph.D. 

 
Acute Geropsychiatry Inpatient Ward, VA Palo Alto Health Care System, Palo Alto, 
CA Supervisor: Ellen Coman, Ph.D. 

 
Brain Injury Rehabilitation Unit, VA Palo Alto Health Care System, Palo Alto, CA. 
Supervisor: Bill Lynch, Ph.D. 

 
1998- 2000: Consultant-Quail Ridge Special Alzheimer’s Care Center, Alzheimer’s Disease 

Education Program, Neuropsychology Services, Department of Neuropsychiatry and 
Behavioral Sciences, Texas Tech University Health Sciences Center. Supervisors: 
David M. Freed, Ph.D., Stephanie L. Harter, Ph.D.  

 
1996- 2000: Research Assistant, Neuropsychological Services, Department of Neuropsychiatry 

and Behavioral Sciences, Texas Tech University Health Sciences Center. 
Supervisors: David M. Freed, Ph.D., Stephanie L. Harter, Ph.D.  

 
1996- 1999: Psychologist-in-Training, Texas Tech University Psychology Clinic. Supervisors: 

James Clopton, Ph.D., Catherine Epkins, Ph.D., Gary Fireman, Ph.D., Charles 
Mahone, Ph.D., Gregory H. Mumma, Ph.D., Barbara Zebb, Ph.D. 

 
Professional Affiliations 
2002-present: Association for Cognitive and Behavior Therapy 

 
Professional References 
Erin L. Cassidy-Eagle, Ph.D., 
Clinical Associate Professor, Psychiatry and Behavioral Sciences 
Stanford University 
401 Quarry Rd, MC 5723 
Stanford, CA 94305 
 
David Hurford, Ph.D. 
Professor 
Chair, Department of Psychology and Counseling 
Pittsburg State University 
1701 S. Broadway 
Pittsburg, KS 66762 
620-235-4521 
 
Jan Mohlman. Ph.D. 
Professor 
Department of Psychology 
William Paterson University 
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300 Pompton Road 
Wayne, New Jersey 07470 
973-720-2148 
 
Janet V. Smith, Ph.D. 
Professor 
Assistant Vice President for Institutional Effectiveness 
Pittsburg State University 
1701 S. Broadway 
Pittsburg, KS 66762 
620-235-4537 


